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Seniors and Long-Term Care 

PO Box 2065 
Halifax, Nova Scotia 

Canada B3J 2X8 

Tel: 902-424-0104 
novascotia.ca/dhw 

 

Licensing Inspection Report ( Annual Inspection ) 
 

Facility: THE ELMS RESTHOME 
 
Address: 

 
 
Date(s) of Inspection: 

 
705 MAIN ST. 
WOLFVILLE NS, B4P 1E9 
 
June 6, 2023 

 
 
Requirements resulting from licensing inspection: 
 
1. LTCPR 6.8.7 

The licensee shall ensure there are procedures in place to direct staff in the 
event of an expected death or an unexpected death. 

 
2. LTCPR 8.4.3 

The licensee shall ensure a stand-alone Infection Prevention and Control 
Committee is implemented or infection prevention and control issues/practices 
are included as a standing agenda item on another appropriate committee. The 
committee shall be multidisciplinary ensuring that the infection prevention and 
control program is regularly reviewed and revised to reflect leading practices 
and provincial direction. 

 
3. LTCPR 7.1.12 

The licensee shall ensure required inspections of the home and equipment are 
completed and documentation is maintained to demonstrate compliance with 
requirements. These include, but are not limited to, manufacturer requirements, 
safety requirements, sprinkler systems, water testing, fire alarms and fuel 
systems. 

 
4. HSCR 27(6), LTCPR 9.2.8 

The licensee shall ensure upon initial employment in a home and a minimum of 
annually thereafter, every staff member is instructed in and understands the 
contents of the All Hazards Plan, the Fire Safety Plan, the Business Continuity 
Plan and the Staff Call Back System Plan as applicable to their individual roles. 
Every staff member shall be thoroughly instructed in the method of evacuation 
during an emergency situation and shall be familiar with the location of all fire 
alarm boxes, extinguishers and exits in the home, prior to commencing active 
duty in the home. 

 



Page 2 of 2  

5. HSCR 27(4), LTCPR 9.2.1.b 
The licensee shall ensure the All Hazards Plan is exercised a minimum of once 
every three years. More frequent exercises shall be completed as required to 
ensure all staff members are knowledgeable. The Business Continuity Plan 
identified below may be incorporated as part of this exercise. 

 
6. LTCPR 6.3.11 

Additional Requirements for Residential Care Facilities - The licensee shall 
ensure each resident's plan of care is based on the needs identified through the 
collection of resident information, referenced in section 6.1, Additional 
Requirements for Residential Care Facilities. 

 
7. LTCPR 7.2.3 

The licensee shall ensure resident council meetings are held monthly. Residents 
and/or authorized designates are notified of meetings in advance and are 
encouraged to participate. 

 
8. LTCPR 9.2.2 a 

The licensee shall ensure there is a documented Business Continuity Plan that 
addresses the operational recovery and continuity of services in the face of a 
disaster, labour disruption or other major outage. The Business Continuity Plan 
includes the following: hazard, vulnerability and risk assessment, mission critical 
activities, recovery strategies, loss of electrical power, water, heat, ventilation 
and waste water services, loss of information technology (computer / telephone / 
fax) priorities, geographic footprint and pandemic situation (pandemic planning is 
undertaken and completed in accordance with direction received from the 
Department.) 

 
9. LTCPR 6.1.11 

Additional Requirements for Residential Care Facilities - The licensee shall 
ensure collection of residents' current information, regarding functional abilities, 
risks, cognition, diet, oral health, pain and discomfort, falls, and recreation, is 
initiated upon admission to the home and completed within two weeks. 
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