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PO Box 488 

Halifax, Nova Scotia 

Canada B3J 2R8 

Tel: 902-424-0104 

novascotia.ca/dhw 

 

Licensing Inspection Report ( Annual Inspection ) 
 

Facility: OAKWOOD TERRACE 
 
Address: 

 
 
Date(s) of Inspection: 

 
10 MOUNT HOPE AVE. 
DARTMOUTH NS, B2Y 4K1 
 
January 7 & 8, 2021 

 
 
Requirements resulting from licensing inspection: 
 
1. LTCPR 8.2.1.g 

The licensee shall ensure policies and procedures that minimize risk to residents, 
staff, volunteers, visitors and the home are developed and followed. These 
include but are not limited to: a safety alerts policy and procedures that includes 
information management, follow up actions and risk mitigation. 

 
2. LTCPR 9.2.10 

The licensee shall ensure a written record for fire drills and exercises outlined 
above, that includes the date, time, location, staff attendance, response times, 
outcomes, areas for improvement, remedial actions and debriefing, is maintained 
by the licensee. 

 
3. LTCPR 8.1.4 

The licensee shall ensure resident and family satisfaction surveys are conducted 
a minimum of annually. 

 
4. LTCPR 8.4.10 

The licensee shall ensure if bars of soap and other personal care items are used 
in resident rooms, they are designated for the use of one resident and are not 
shared. 

 
5. HSCR 25(1), LTCPR 6.2.13 

Every home for special care shall have a medical health advisor who shall be a 
duly qualified medical practitioner. 
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6. LTCPR 12.1.6 
The licensee shall ensure hazardous products that may be harmful to residents 
are secured at all times and are not accessible to residents. They are stored and 
disposed of in accordance with established safety practices/manufacturers' 
recommendations. 

 
7. HSCR 44A(2), LTCPR 6.2.15 

Additional Requirements for Nursing Homes - The licensee shall ensure an 
interdisciplinary pharmacy committee, consisting of at least the Administrator of 
the Home, Medical Advisor, Pharmacist, Director of Resident Care and Clinical 
Dietitian, meets a minimum of every six months. The pharmacy committee shall 
meet regularly to establish and monitor guidelines consistent with these 
regulations in relation to the storage, administration and control of drugs in the 
home. 
 

8. HSCR 27(4), 9.2.3.c 
The licensee shall ensure the Staff Call Back Plan is activated a minimum of 
once per year to determine the ability of staff members to respond in emergency 
situations. 
 

9. LTCPR 7.2.3 
The licensee shall ensure resident council meetings are held monthly. Residents 
and/or authorized designates are notified of meetings in advance and are 
encouraged to participate. 

 
 
Outstanding requirements from previous inspection(s): 
 
1. Date of inspection: January 6 & 7, 2020  

 
LTCPR 7.1.7 
The licensee shall ensure the home's policies are reviewed a minimum of every 
three years, or more frequently as required to ensure they are current, and they 
are revised as needed. 

 
2. Date of inspection: January 6 & 7, 2020  

 
HSCR 20A(1), LTCPR 9.1.2 
The licensee shall ensure a labour disruption contingency plan, which may be 
included in the business continuity plan, is developed in consultation with service 
partners as appropriate. 


