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Seniors and Long-Term 
 

 
PO Box 488 
Halifax, Nova Scotia 
Canada  B3J 2R8 

Licensing Inspection Report ( Annual Inspection ) 
 

Facility: WOLFVILLE NURSING HOMES LIMITED 
 
Address: 

 
 
Date(s) of Inspection: 

 
601 MAIN ST. 
WOLFVILLE NS, B4P 1E6 
 
September 13, 2022 

 
Requirements resulting from licensing inspection: 
 
1. HSCR 27(10)(a), LTCPR 9.2.8 

The licensee shall ensure upon initial employment in a home and a minimum of 
annually thereafter, every staff member is instructed in and understands the 
contents of the All Hazards Plan, the Fire Safety Plan, the Business Continuity 
Plan and the Staff Call Back System Plan as applicable to their individual roles. 
The administrator of a home for special care is responsible for training staff and 
residents on emergency plan procedures and conducting emergency drills with 
staff and residents. 

 
2. LTCPR 7.1.12 

The licensee shall ensure required inspections of the home and equipment are 
completed and documentation is maintained to demonstrate compliance with 
requirements. These include, but are not limited to, manufacturer requirements, 
safety requirements, sprinkler systems, water testing, fire alarms and fuel 
systems. 

 
3. LTCPR 6.1.5a 

Additional Requirements for Nursing Homes - The licensee shall ensure 
residents have an interdisciplinary assessment of risk, functional abilities, 
cognition, nutrition, oral health (see section 6.6), pain and discomfort, falls risk, 
and recreation, initiated upon admission to the home and completed within two 
weeks. 

 
4. HSCR 20B, LTCPR 7.4.3 

The licensee shall ensure management and staff meetings are held a minimum 
of quarterly. 

 
5. LTCPR 8.4.10 

The licensee shall ensure if bars of soap and other personal care items are 
used in resident rooms, they are designated for the use of one resident and are 
not shared. 
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6. LTCPR 6.5.2.c 
The licensee shall ensure the following processes are developed and followed: 
labeling of food in refrigerators and discarding of expired food. 

 
7. HSCR 27(11), LTCPR 9.2.4.g 

No person shall be maintained in a home for special care or any part thereof 
that is not approved by a Fire Marshal with respect to fire safety. 

 
8. LTCPR 6.2.9 

The licensee shall ensure interventions are in accordance with resident goals of 
care, clinical guidelines, leading practices and the professional 
regulatory/licensing bodies. 

 
 
Outstanding requirements from previous inspection(s): 
 
1. Date of inspection: May 3, 2022; September 13, 2022 

LTCPR 12.2.2.2.e, LTCPR 12.2.1.5 
The licensee shall ensure aesthetic, functional and surface integrity of the 
following are maintained: building systems, furnishings and equipment such as, 
but not limited to, plumbing, heating, ventilation, power, lighting, emergency 
power, fire alarm, voice and data in accordance with manufacturers' guidelines 
and/or requirements. 

 
2. Date of inspection: May 3, 2022; September 13, 2022 

LTCPR 6.1.3 
The licensee shall ensure results of assessments are documented on the 
resident record, are communicated appropriately to staff and become the basis 
for the resident plan of care. 
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